
JLS Empowering Jamaica @JLSEmpoweringJa @JLSEmpoweringJamaicainstagram

Connect with us:-

Continue to watch this space monthly for the Jamaica Library Service News feature being published exclusively in The Gleaner’s Youthlink 
magazine.  For further details please visit the JLS website at  or contact the                 www.jls.gov.jm

JLS Headquarters at 926-3310 -2.

 Jamaica Library Service News

 Major  Partners

JLS: Using Technology to Empower Individuals and Communities for Development  

Jamaica Library Service
An Agency of the Ministry of Education, Youth & Information

JLS Global Libraries Initiative Project

JLS Unveils New Logo

The Jamaica Library Service (JLS), an 
Agency of the Ministry of Educa�on, 
Youth & Informa�on has recently 
unveiled its new colourful logo as part 
of a new rebranding strategy.

T h e  n e w  l o g o  c a p t u r e s  t h e 
transforma�on of the JLS into a 
modern educa�onal research and 
recrea�onal centre as well as its 
transforma�ve effect on lives.  The 
design depicts a reposi�oning of the 
JLS brand through technology, to its 
various target audiences, set in a colour 
scheme of canary yellow, violet purple 
and lime green that captures the 
dynamic spheres of the JLS.   

D irector General,  Karen Barton 
indicated that it is important to 
strengthen the JLS as a brand that 
appeals to all ci�zens and to create 
greater awareness of the value of 
public libraries to communi�es. She 
also stated that the JLS has been 
transforming lives through advance 
technologies and the offering of a 
range of programmes and services for 
adults and children. 

Marke�ng & Communica�ons Manager 
for the Global Libraries ICT Project,               
Andrea C. Whyte also emphasized that 
the overall rebranding exercise serves 
as a means of projec�ng the JLS as 
outstanding with a posi�ve brand 
iden�ty within the marketplace. She 
a l s o  i n d i c a t e d  t h a t  v a r i e d 
adver�sements in the form of print, 
radio, television as well as digital 
billboards will be rolled-out in order to 
reinforce the new iden�ty of the JLS. 
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